
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 13-6035

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Trash Can Liners
FOR:  

TIME & (July 1, 2013 through May 31, 2014)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., May 9, 2013

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

1. TRASH CAN LINERS

Est. Annual Usage 240 cases/yr, SAWS Item No. 9330

 Bag Trash 55-60 gal 2. mil black 38x 58 in LLDPE Interpast Mfg. Code Price per case 27.30 27.47 29.89 30.79 30.38 38.89 NO BID

SL 385820K or approved equal 20 bags per roll 5 rolls per case weight Total 6,552.00 6,592.80 7,173.60 7,389.60 7,291.20 9,333.60

capacity 120 lbs. dry  

If bidding an alternate must complete below  

Mfg. CoveBay Inteplast  Republic Bag Co.   

 Mfg. Code 306505 SL3858200K  CR602B   

Size 38x58 38x58 38x58   

Qty bags per case 100 100 100   

Weight Capacity 120 lbs. 120 lbs. 120 lbs.   

Thickness in Mil 2 2 2 mil   

Color  Black/Gray Black Black   

2. Est. Annual Usage 160 cases/yr, SAWS Item No. 9329

 Bag Trash 33 gal 2 mil Black, size 33 x 39 in LLDPE, Inteplast Mfg Code Price per case 16.05 16.10 17.19 18.12 20.31 22.67 NO BID

SL339200K or approved equals 20 bags per roll 5 rolls per case weight Total 2,568.00 2,576.00 2,750.40 2,899.20 3,249.60 3,627.20

capacity 120 lbs. dry

If bidding an alternate must complete below

Mfg. Safeway Inteplast Republic Bag Co.   

Mfg. Code L33392.0B Si3339200K CR402B   

 Size 33x39 33X39 33x40   

Qty bags per case 100 100.00 100   

Weight Capacity 120 120 lbs. 120 lbs.   

Thickness in Mil 2 mil 2 2 mil   

Color  Black Black Black   

3. Est. Annual Usage 200 cases/yr. SAWS Item No. 26036

 Liner Trash Natural 38 x 63 in 1.5 mil LLDPE Inteplast Mfg. Code SL3863 300 Price per case 13.95 14.20 16.15 16.42 29.38 18.91 NO BID

or approved equal, 25 bags per roll; 2 rolls per case, Dry weight capacity 150 lbs. Total 2,790.00 2,840.00 3,230.00 3,284.00 5,876.00 3,782.00

If bidding an alternate must complete below

Mfg. Safeway Inteplast Republic Bag Co.   

Mfg. Code L386315CL SL3863 300 RR3863XAC   

Size 38x63 38x63 38x63   

 Qty bags per case 50 50 50   

Thickness in Mil 1.5 mil 1.5 mil 1.65 mil   

Color  Natural Natural Clear   

4. Est. Annual Usage 100 cases/yr., SAWS Item No. 26037

 Liner Trash Natural 33 x 40 in 18 microns Hi Desnsity, Inteplast Mfg. Code Price per case 19.62 19.95 21.19 25.26 26.25 29.44 NO BID

IP 334022N or approved equal, 25 bags per roll 10 rolls per case, dry weight capacity 100 lbs. Total 1,962.00 1,995.00 2,119.00 2,526.00 2,625.00 2,944.00

If bidding an alternate must complete below

Mfg. CoveBay Inteplast Republic Bag Co.   

Mfg. Code NCSR334019N IP334018N  N334022CR   

Size 33x40 33x40 33x40   

 Qty bags per case 250 250 250   

Thickness in Mil 19 Micron 18 Mic 22 Microns   

Color  Natural Natural Natural    
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5. Est. Annual Usage 110 cases/yr., SAWS Item No. 26038  

 Liner Trash Natural 24 x 24 in 8 microns Hi Density Inteplast Mfg. Code Price per case 15.52 15.66 16.84 17.62 17.35 21.73 NO BID

S242408N or approved equals, 50 bags per roll and 20 rolls per case, dry weight capacity 25 lbs. Total 1,707.20 1,722.60 1,852.40 1,938.20 1,908.50 2,390.30

If bidding an alternate must complete below

Mfg. Safeway Inteplast Republic Bag Co.   

Mfg. Code H242408N S242408N N242408CR   

Size 24x24 24x24 24x24   

 Qty bags per case 1000 1000 1000   

Thickness in Mil 8 Mic 8 Mic 8 micron   

Color  Natural Natural Natural    

6. Est. Annual Usage 10 cases/yr., SAWS Item No. 33742   

 Liners Clear 38 x 63 in 2.5 mil LLDPE Interplast Mfg. Code IP SL 3863 400 or approved equal Price per case 25.55 27.95 27.95 27.70 53.00 31.04 NO BID

25 bags per roll and 2 rolls per case, dry weight capacity 120 lbs. Total 255.50 279.50 279.50 277.00 530.00 310.40

If bidding an alternate must complete below

Mfg. Safeway Inteplast Republic Bag Co.   

Mfg. Code L38632.5C SL3863 400 RR38632C   

Size 38x60  38x63   

 Qty bags per case 50  100   

Thickness in Mil 2.5 Mil  1.3 mil   

Color  Clear  Clear   

*    

GRAND TOTAL TOTAL 15,834.70 16,005.90 17,404.90 18,314.00 21,480.30 22,387.50 NO BID

    

Net Net Net Net Net Net

Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

Delivery Days
    
 
*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

All American Poly Matera Paper Co. SAWS Website
Central Poly Corp. Pollock Paper Dist.
D/V Supply, Inc. Safeway Supply, Inc.
Evco Partners dba Burgoon Co. Sanivac/Davis
Gulf Coast Paper Co. Sunshine Distributors
Interboro Packaging Corp. Unipak Corp.
LBI Group Co. Z and V Enterprise 
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